
Special Report 
 

Taking Care of Chester 
 
As recently reported, USMNEWS.net is now receiving documents relating to the 
publication of Treasured Past, Golden Future, the centennial history of USM that was 
commissioned by former USM president Martha Saunders back in 2008.   
 

 
 
Part of that earlier news item indicated that, in addition to a contract executed by USM 
and the University Press of Mississippi (UPoM), a separate agreement was executed by 
USM and Chester “Bo” Morgan, then a history professor at Delta State University.  This 
Special Report provides some details regarding that particular agreement. 
 
The insert below details the “agreement” between USM and Morgan, noting in item #1 
that Morgan is expected to “. . . research, write, and prepare . . .” the centennial history 
of the university.  The previous USMNEWS.net report indicates that USM agreed to pay 
UPoM up to, and possibly more than, $40,000 for publication of the book.  

 

 
 
Just like the contract between USM and UPoM, the high point in the agreement between 
USM and Morgan comes in item #7, which is inserted below: 
 

 

http://www.usmnews.net/BREAKING%20NEWS%20Documents%20Regarding%20Bo%20Morgans%20History%20Arriving.pdf


Item #7 indicates that Morgan took a leave of absence from Delta State University 
during the 2008-09 academic year in order to visit USM and write its centennial history.  
Except for perhaps what he was doing for USM during that year, Morgan was in essence 
a visiting professor, at least according to sources.  What is really unique about Morgan’s 
case, however, is not that USM would pay his state salary while visiting, it is instead that 
USM would provide lodging and meals throughout the academic year in which Morgan 
was penning the book, all in addition to mileage between Cleveland and Hattiesburg.  
Clearly, this was a special arrangement, and a costly one to Mississippi taxpayers and 
USM students. 
 

 
 

On top of all the goodies provided to Morgan for authoring Treasured Past, Golden 
Future, contract item #8, which is inserted above, stipulates that he receive a 5% royalty 
on all net sales.  As sources put it, the centennial history is, to Morgan at least, the gift 
that truly keeps on giving. 

 

 


