
Special Report 
 

Why didn’t this Trip Exhaust Nissan’s Travel Budget? 
An Investigative Series on Travel by CoB Faculty 

 
 
This Special Report is yet another example of the major issues regarding CoB travel that 
have been pointed out at usmpride.com.  An open records request turned up the details of 
an August 2004 trip to Germany made by Edward Nissan (Professor of Economics).  The 
screen below captures the purpose of Nissan’s trip: 
 

 
 
As the insert above points out, Nissan planned to attend a “Conference on Trade & 
currency” in Frankfurt, Germany.  That Conference appears to have taken place from 
August 1-6, 2004, as the screen below indicates: 
 

 
 
Nissan’s total meals/lodging accounted for $681.20 of the total cost of this trip.  Another 
$882.02 was consumed in Travel by Public Carrier, as the insert below points out: 
 

 
 



It’s also interesting that (i) Nissan stayed in Germany from July 27 through August 7 of 
2004, and (ii) all of Nissan’s movements are between New York and Frankfurt, not 
Hattiesburg and Frankfurt.  Not only is this another example of the suspect nature of 
Nissan’s travel habits, it also supports the possibility that Nissan did not get back to USM 
to start Fall semester of 2004, given that it was already August 7th and he headed to New 
York from Frankfurt instead of to Hattiesburg.  Nissan’s penchant for missing large 
stretches of class time is now part of CoB lore. 
 
The screen below concludes the paperwork on this trip to Germany: 
 

 
 
Note that Nissan’s expenses totaled $1,621.22, though he was reimbursed $600.00 of that 
amount.   
 
One would think that this trip might have exhausted Nissan’s travel allowance for the 
entire 2004-2005 academic year.  It wasn’t even close to being exhausted, as other reports 
at usmpride.com have pointed out.  Not only did Nissan get this $600 allowance, he also 
received $1,900 in reimbursements for two separate trips to San Francisco – one in Fall 
of 2004 and the other in Spring of 2005. 
 
And, Nissan’s 2004-05 travels did not stop there.  Consider the following trip to Myrtle 
Beach, for the Annual Meeting of the Academy of Economics and Finance, that Nissan 
made in February of 2005: 
 



        
 
This trip cost USM a total of $917.90, as the following screen indicates: 
 

 
 
Then there’s Nissan’s December 2004 trip to the IPFT Expo in Jackson, as the screen 
below presents: 
 

 
 
That trip came to a total of $65, as reported below: 
 



 
 
In addition, there’s Nissan’s November of 2004 trip to the Regional Science Conference 
(what ever that means) in Seattle: 
 

 
 
This trip cost USM another $953.15, as the screen below indicates: 
 

 
 
Let’s not omit Nissan’s March 2005 trip to New Orleans to attend the Southwest 
Economic Association meetings, as seen below: 
 



 
 
This trip consumed another $630 (see below): 
 

 
 
That brings us to about $5,100 so far, give or take a dollar or two.  This will easily 
qualify as a “high dollar travel year” for Nissan, more than four times over.  
 
Future reports will also examine Nissan’s travels.   


